
Bid Tabulation: 

RFB 41-23NOV20 - Custodial 

Services - Term & Supply 
Arment Enterprises Classic Cleaning ServPro 

Bid Tabulation QTY 

4.10.1 Daily Custodial services 1 $ 80.00 33.75 NO BID 

performed daily as described in 

paragraph 2.3.2 - S. Tom Bass Road 

and Bridge location. 

Total Price for One Time per Day of 

Service 

4.10.1 Extended by 248 1 $ 19,840.00 $ 8,368.99 NO BID 

4.10.2 Weekly Custodial services 1 $ 30.00 $ 16.87 NO BID 

performed once weekly as described 

in paragraph 2.3.3 - S. Tom Bass Road 

and Bridge location. 

Total Price for One Time per Week of 

Service 

4.10.2 Extended by 52 1 $ 1,560.00 $ 877.39 NO BID 

4.10.3 Weekly Custodial services at 1 $ 65.00 $ 56.24 NO BID 

the Hallsville Road and Bridge location 

(shall include tasks in 2.3.2 and 2.3.3 

performed once weekly) 

Total Price for One Time per Week of 

Service 

4.10.3 Extended by 52 1 $ 3,380.00 $ 2,924.65 NO BID 

4.10.4 Strip and Wax VCT Tile Areas - 1 $ 850.00 $ 674.92 NO BID 

Firm, Fixed Price per single application 

4.10.4 Extended by 2 1 $ 1,700.00 $ 1,349.84 NO BID 

4.10.5 Buff VCTTile Areas- Firm, Fixed 1 $ 90.00 $ 101.24 NO BID 

Price per single application 

4.10.5 Extended by 12 1 $ 1,080.00 $ 1,214.85 NO BID 

4.10.6 All Other Temporary Custodial 1 $ 23.00 $ 17.00 NO BID 

Tasks performed as requested, as 

needed, if needed. 

Firm, Fixed Price Per Hour 

1st Renewal Period% Adjustment 2% 5% NO BID 

2nd Renewal Period% Adjustment 2% 5% NO BID 

3rd Renewal Period% Adjustment 2% 5% NO BID 

Co-Op Unknown Unknown 
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